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Dallas, Texas (July 22, 2013) -- 
 

It Has Been a Good Year for Richardson Resident Dot Adler 
 
It has been a good year for Dorothy A. (Dot) Adler, although she has had many good 
years and seen many successes in her sixty years of volunteering on behalf of the 
Republican Party and Republican candidates.  She was recognized by the Dallas County 
Council of Republican Women with the Anita Hill Lifetime Achievement Award in 
December, 2012.  Ms. Adler covered the founding convention of the Texas Federation of 
Republican Women as a young reporter for the San Antonio Light, and says she cast her 
first vote for Dwight D. Eisenhower and has been voting Republican ever since.  
 
As a long-time, enthusiastic volunteer, she has many friends among Republican office 
holders.  When some of her friends in the Texas Legislature heard she was the recipient 
of the Anita Hill Award, they took it a step further.  Representatives Angie Chen Button 
and Stefani Carter jointly authored a House Resolution and Senator John Carona authored 
a Senate Resolution honoring her for her many efforts and activities on behalf of 
Republicans.  The Resolutions were read before the House and the Senate during the 
Legislative Day organized by the Texas Federation of Republican Women (TFRW) in 
April, 2013. 
 
However, the accolades were not over.  She was honored again at a special reception at 
the Bush Library in conjunction with a TFRW Board Meeting in Dallas.  Among the 
dignitaries was former President Bush, himself, who recalled the time when Ms. Adler 
had been a full-time volunteer in the Dallas finance committee office of the George W. 
Bush Presidential Exploratory Committee for Texas, quipping “Dot may not remember 
me, but I remember her.”  TFRW President Carolyn Hodges brought Ms. Adler a 
congratulatory proclamation adopted by TFRW, and Representative Dan Branch 
presented her with a Texas flag that had been flown over the capitol in Austin. 
 
Even though this has been quite a year, Ms. Adler is not done volunteering.  She 
continues to be active in the Dallas Downtown Republican Women’s Club, the Dallas 
County Council of Republican Women, and the TI Alumni Association. 

# # # 
 
[Photograph attached: (left) State Representative Dan Branch, (center) Dot Adler, (right) 
Carolyn Hodges, President of TFRW] 
 
The Dallas Downtown Republican Women’s Club (DDRWC) is a not-for-profit 
organization of professional women who support Republican candidates at the local, state 
and national level, promote programs to inform the electorate, and participate in 
community service activities. For more information see www.ddrwc.org 


